



August 25, 2023

Nancy Marconi
Registrar
Ontario Energy Board
P.O. Box 2319
2300 Yonge Street
Toronto ON
M4P 1E4

Dear Ms. Marconi,

**RE: EB-2022-0024 Elexicon Energy Inc. 2023 Distribution Rate Application
CCMBC Cost Claim – Time Docket Correction**

Attached is the corrected Time Docket that was attached to Cost Claim of the Coalition of Concerned Manufacturers and Businesses of Canada (CCMBC) for the EB-2022-0024 proceeding that was filed on August 4, 2023. The review of the cost claim found that there was a typographical error for the time claimed to review the OEB decision.

Respectfully submitted on behalf of CCMBC,

Tom Ladanyi
Consultant representing CCMBC

cc. Jocelyn Bamford (CCMBC)
Elexicon

TL Energy Consultants Inc.

Time Docket

Consultant: Tom Ladanyi
Proceeding: EB-2022-0024 Elexicon

Date	Description of Work	Hours	Total Hours
2022-09-14	Review Application and Evidence	2.0	
	Review Application and Evidence Total		2.0
2022-09-25	Preparation of Interrogatories	3.0	
2022-09-26	Preparation of Interrogatories	4.0	
2022-09-27	Preparation of Interrogatories	4.0	
2022-09-28	Preparation of Interrogatories	3.0	
	Preparation of Interrogatories Total		14.0
2022-10-22	Review of Interrogatory Responses	2.0	
2022-10-25	Review of Interrogatory Responses	2.0	
2023-01-11	Review of Interrogatory Responses	1.0	
	Review of Interrogatory Responses Total		5.0
2023-01-12	Meeting with Other Parties	0.5	
2023-01-13	Meeting with Other Parties	1.5	
2023-03-25	Meeting with Other Parties	1.5	
2023-04-01	Meeting with Other Parties	1.5	
	Meeting with Other Parties Total		5.0
2023-01-13	Technical Conference Preparation	2.0	
2023-01-14	Technical Conference Preparation	3.0	
2023-01-15	Technical Conference Preparation	3.0	
2023-01-16	Technical Conference Preparation	3.0	
2023-01-17	Technical Conference Preparation	1.0	
	Technical Conference Preparation Total		12.0
2023-01-17	Technical Conference Attendance	7.0	
2023-01-18	Technical Conference Attendance	7.0	
	Technical Conference Attendance Total		14.0
2023-01-27	Review Undertakings Responses	2.0	2.0
2023-01-27	Submission on Hearing	1.0	1.0
2023-02-12	Communication with Client	2.0	
2023-03-29	Communication with Client	1.0	
2023-04-03	Communication with Client	0.5	
	Communication with Client Total		3.5
2023-02-26	Review Confidential Undertaking	0.5	0.5

2023-03-26	Hearing Preparation	3.0	
2023-03-30	Hearing Preparation	6.0	
2023-04-02	Hearing Preparation	3.0	
	Hearing Preparation Total		12.0
2023-03-31	Hearing Attendance	7.0	
2023-04-03	Hearing Attendance	7.0	
	Hearing Attendance Total		14.0
2023-04-13	Argument Submission	5.0	
2023-04-19	Argument Submission	5.0	
2023-04-29	Argument Submission	6.0	
2023-05-03	Argument Submission	5.0	
2023-05-04	Argument Submission	1.0	
	Argument Submission Total		22.0
2023-07-06	Review Decision	1.5	1.5
	Total Hours for Proceeding		108.5